

**C. Alfred Mackenzie
Attorney at Law**

P. O. Box 2003
Waco, Texas 76703
Telephone: (254) 848-9800
Facsimile: (254) 848-9974
E-mail: AMackenzie@Texas-Appeals.com

November 9, 2017

TO: Andrew Lucas, Esq.
Somervell County Attorney
P.O. Box 1335
Glen Rose, Texas 76043

FOR: *State of Texas ex rel. Best v. Harper*
Texas Supreme Court

Date	Description	Hours	Amount
10/25/2017	Review briefs in preparation for oral argument.	1.1	\$ 220.00
10/30/2017	Review appellate record in preparation for oral argument.	1.3	\$ 260.00
11/02/2017	Review reporter's record of hearings and legal authority in preparation for oral argument.	3.4	\$ 680.00
11/05/2017	Review and outline legal authority, record, and issues in preparation for oral argument.	3.6	\$ 720.00
11/06/2017	Review and outline legal authority, record, and issues in preparation for oral argument.	5.2	\$1,040.00
11/07/2017	Prepare for oral argument.	3.3	\$ 660.00
11/08/2017	Present oral argument at Texas Supreme Court; additional research of cases on mootness in response to inquiry by Justice Boyd.	4.5	\$ 900.00
	For Current Legal Services	22.4	\$4,480.00

Recap of Hours

Timekeeper	Hours	Hourly Rate	Total
C. Alfred Mackenzie	22.4	200.00	\$4480.00

Expenses

09/09/2017	Texas Supreme Court – Oral Argument Fee	75.00
11/08/2017	Mileage to/from Austin (195 miles x 0.535)	104.33
	Total Expenses	\$179.33

Total Current Payment Due
(payable upon receipt)

\$4,659.33

Make Checks Payable to: C. Alfred Mackenzie

11/9/17 Approved for payment
Outside Expense
Andrew Jant

**C. Alfred Mackenzie
Attorney at Law**

P. O. Box 2003
Waco, Texas 76703
Telephone: (254) 848-9800
Facsimile: (254) 848-9974
E-mail: AMackenzie@Texas-Appeals.com

July 11, 2018

TO: Andrew Lucas, Esq.
Somervell County Attorney
P.O. Box 1335
Glen Rose, Texas 76043

FOR: *State of Texas ex rel. Best v. Harper*
Texas Supreme Court

Date	Description	Hours	Amount
06/29/2018	Review opinions from Supreme Court; telephone conference with Andrew Lucas.	0.7	\$ 140.00
07/05/2018	Research and draft Motion for Rehearing	1.8	\$ 360.00
07/06/2018	Draft Motion for Rehearing.	3.7	\$ 740.00
07/10/2018	Telephone conference with Andrew Lucas; finalize motion for rehearing for filing.	0.6	\$ 120.00
	For Current Legal Services	6.8	\$1,360.00

Recap of Hours

Timekeeper	Hours	Hourly Rate	Total
C. Alfred Mackenzie	6.8	200.00	\$1360.00

Expenses

07/10/2018	Texas Supreme Court – Filing Fee	15.43	
	Total Expenses		\$15.43

Total Current Payment Due
(payable upon receipt)

\$1,375.43

Make Checks Payable to: C. Alfred Mackenzie

7/11/18 Approved for payment
Outside Expense
Andrew J. J.

**C. Alfred Mackenzie
Attorney at Law**

P. O. Box 2003
Waco, Texas 76703
Telephone: (254) 848-9800
Facsimile: (254) 848-9974
E-mail: AMackenzie@Texas-Appeals.com

February 28, 2019

TO: Andrew Lucas, Esq.
Somervell County Attorney
P.O. Box 1335
Glen Rose, Texas 76043

FOR: *State of Texas ex rel. Best v. Harper*
Cause No. C10369

Date	Description	Hours	Amount
02/20/2019	Telephone conference with Andrew Lucas regarding case on remand and request for pre-trial scheduling conference with district court.	0.2	\$ 40.00
02/26/2019	Review notice of judicial assignment; draft Response to Motion to Dismiss and State's Original Answer to Harper's Counter-Claim.	5.3	\$1,060.00
02/27/2019	Telephone conference with Andrew Lucas; finalize response and answer for filing.	1.1	\$ 220.00
	For Current Legal Services	6.6	\$1,320.00

Recap of Hours

Timekeeper	Hours	Hourly Rate	Total
C. Alfred Mackenzie	6.6	200.00	\$1320.00

Total Current Payment Due
(payable upon receipt)

\$1,320.00

3/4/19 Approved
for payment
Andrew J. J. J.

Make Checks Payable to: C. Alfred Mackenzie

**C. Alfred Mackenzie
Attorney at Law**

P. O. Box 2003
Waco, Texas 76703
Telephone: (254) 848-9800
Facsimile: (254) 848-9974
E-mail: AMackenzie@Texas-Appeals.com

March 31, 2019

TO: Andrew Lucas, Esq.
Somervell County Attorney
P.O. Box 1335
Glen Rose, Texas 76043

FOR: *State of Texas ex rel. Best v. Harper*
Cause No. C10369

Date	Description	Hours	Amount
03/06/2019	Correspondence from Andrew Lucas regarding pre-trial scheduling conference; review notice of hearing.	0.2	\$ 40.00
03/25/2019	Review recent Supreme Court case regarding scope of waiver of immunity; correspondence with Andrew Lucas regarding scheduling conference.	0.3	\$ 60.00
03/26/2019	Review response and answer in preparation for scheduling conference.	0.3	\$ 60.00
03/27/2019	Travel to Glen Rose; attend scheduling conference; travel to Waco; prepare request for disclosure.	4.2	\$ 840.00
03/28/2019	Serve request for disclosure on Defendant.	0.1	\$ 20.00
03/29/2019	Review Defendant's Request for Disclosure to the State; review correspondence requesting deposition.	0.4	\$ 80.00
	For Current Legal Services	5.5	\$1,100.00

Recap of Hours

Timekeeper	Hours	Hourly Rate	Total
C. Alfred Mackenzie	5.6	200.00	\$1100.00

Total Current Payment Due
(payable upon receipt)

\$1,100.00

Make Checks Payable to: C. Alfred Mackenzie

4/2/19 Approved for
Payment
Andrew J. [Signature]

(254) 776-3336
TIN 74-2129372

ATTN: COUNTY ATTORNEY
SOMERVELL COUNTY
P O BOX 1335
GLEN ROSE TX 76043

Page: 02/28/201
ACCOUNT NUMBER: 30031
12

GENERAL

02/20/2019 MWD Provide authorities to Alfred Mackenzie to assist with remand of Anti-slapp case--authorities showing county attorney to be acting for the state and not the county in enforcing state law.

FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED

92.5

TOTAL CURRENT WORK

92.5

BALANCE DUE

\$92.5

3/18/19

Approved for payment
Outside Expense
Candice J. J. P.

Make check payable to Haley & Olson PC and mail to our address noted above.
Write your account number on your check.